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5038-S.E AMH KLIP ADAM 529

ESSB 5038 - H AMD TO CRJ COMM AMD (H-1306.2/21) 481
By Representative Klippert

NOT ADOPTED 03/28/2021

On page 2, line 32 of the striking amendment, after "(a)" insert 
"(i)"

On page 2, line 34 of the striking amendment, after 
"demonstration" strike "." and insert "if:

(A)  A duly authorized state or local law enforcement officer has 
advised the person of the permitted demonstration and directed the 
person to leave until he or she no longer possesses or controls the 
firearm or other weapon; and 

(B) The person does not leave the location within a reasonable 
time after the notice and direction from the law enforcement officer. 

(ii)"

On page 2, line 37 of the striking amendment, after "(b)" insert 
"(i)"

On page 2, beginning on line 38 of the striking amendment, after 
"demonstration" strike all material through "weapon." on page 3, line 
2 and insert "if:

(A) A duly authorized state or local law enforcement officer has 
advised the person of the permitted demonstration and directed the 
person to leave until he or she no longer possesses or controls the 
firearm or other weapon; and 

(B) The person does not leave the location within a reasonable 
time after the notice and direction from the law enforcement officer.

(ii)"
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EFFECT:   Makes the restrictions on the open carry of firearms 
or other weapons applicable only if the person has been advised of 
the permitted demonstration or prohibited location by a law 
enforcement officer and the person does not leave the location 
within a reasonable time after receiving the notice.

On page 6, line 6 of the striking amendment, after "the hearing or 
meeting" insert "if:

(a) A duly authorized state or local law enforcement officer has 
advised the person of the location and directed the person to leave 
until he or she no longer possesses or controls the firearm or other 
weapon; and 

(b) The person does not leave the location within a reasonable 
time after the notice and direction from the law enforcement officer"

--- END ---


