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HB 1503
Title: An act relating to performance audits of the judicial branch.

Brief Description: Encouraging the office of the administrator for the courts to conduct
performance audits.

Sponsors: Representatives Miloscia, O’Brien, Haigh, Lantz, Lovick, Moeller, Upthegrove
and Anderson.

Brief Summary of Bill

· Encourages the Office of the Administrator for the Courts to conduct performance
audits of courts.

Hearing Date: 2/11/03

Staff: Edie Adams (786-7180).

Background:

A number of programs have been instituted across state government to improve government
efficiency and accountability.

The Joint Legislative Audit and Review Committee (JLARC) conducts performance audits,
performance reviews, sunset reviews and other studies as directed by the Legislature. In
addition the JLARC develops a biennial performance audit work plan that identifies state
agency programs for evaluation. "Performance audit" as defined for the purposes of the
JLARC’s responsibilities means an objective and systematic assessment to help improve
efficiency, effectiveness and accountability. Performance audits include measuring whether
resources are being economically and efficiently used and whether or not desired outcomes
and results are being achieved, and the causes of failure to meet efficiency and outcome
goals.

The State Auditor conducts financial audits and is authorized to perform or participate in
performance verifications and performance audits as authorized by the Legislature in the
omnibus biennial appropriations acts or in the performance audit work plan approved by the
JLARC. The Office of Financial Management provides professional and technical assistance

House Bill Analysis HB 1503- 1 -



to assist state agencies in the development of strategic plans that include the mission of the
agency and its programs, measurable goals, strategies, and performance measurement
systems. Under executive order, all state agencies are to develop and implement programs to
improve the quality, efficiency, and effectiveness of public services they provide using
quality improvement, business process redesign, employee involvement, and other quality
improvement techniques.

The Office of the Administrator for the Courts (OAC) is charged with administering various
aspects of the state court system. One of the duties of the OAC is to examine the
administrative methods and systems employed in the offices of the judges, clerks and other
court employees and make recommendations for the improvement of these court methods and
systems.

Summary of Bill:

The OAC is encouraged to conduct performance audits of courts in accordance with criteria
and methods developed by the Board for Judicial Administration (BJA). The BJA is
encouraged to consider quality improvement programs, audits and scoring. The OAC is
encouraged to submit the results of the audits to the Chief Justice of the Supreme Court and
any applicable boards or committees established under the authority of the Supreme Court.

Appropriation: None.

Fiscal Note: Available.

Effective Date: The bill takes effect ninety days after adjournment of session in which bill
is passed.
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