
ANALYSIS OF HOUSE BILL1452
Makingavailable cancerscreening tolow-income women.

Health CareCommittee February 15,1999
WashingtonStateHouse ofRepresentatives

SPONSORS: Representatives Kastama and Huff.

BACKGROUND: Breast cancer istheleading causeofdeath, fromall causes, ofwomen between
the ages of 35 and 54. InWashingtonStatetherewere an estimated 3,800 breast cancer
diagnoses last year, whichresulted in900 deaths.All women areatrisk forbreast cancer.The
two most significant risk factors arebeingfemaleand getting older. 18.4 percent ofall breast
cancers occurinwomen ages40-49.Approximately 200 women will bediagnosed withinvasive
cervical cancerin1999. Over50 ofthis total areexpected todiefromthedisease this year.

However,when detection isearly there isa greater chanceofcureand more treatment. There
isno known cureforadvancedbreast orcervical cancer.Mortality rates forbothcancers are
falling, thedropisattributed tobetter and more frequent screening, aswellas tomore effective
treatment. Women whose incomeistoohightomake them eligible forMedicaid buttoolow to
afford health careinsurance, orwomen who havelost their health careinsurance ina divorce or
who work forcompaniesthatdon’tprovide health careinsurance, runtherisk of not having
accesstopreventive health care.

The AmericanCancerSociety recommends mammogram screening everyone totwo yearsfor
women betweentheage of40 and 49,withannualscreening after that. They alsorecommend
that Women 18 yearsand older should havea Pap test and pelvic exam everyyear.The average
costofscreening is$200 perpatient.

Currently, thestate does nothave a non-Medicaid programforscreening low incomewomen
between theagesof40 and 49 forbreast and cervical cancer.

SUMMARY: The DepartmentofHealth isrequired todevelop a programformakingbreast and
cervical cancerscreening available tolow incomewomen betweentheagesof40 and 49. The
department isrequired todefine low incomeand administer theprogramwithno more thanten
percent ofthetotal appropriation. The department isalso required toreport totheLegislature by
December 1, 2000, and annually thereafter on thedepartmental administrative expenditures,
countyadministrative expenses, expensesfordirect services, and thenumber ofwomen served
by theprogram.

An appropriation oftwo million dollars, oras much as may be necessary isrequested fromthe
general fund.
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