
HOUSE BILL REPORT
HB 1044

As Reported By House Committee On:
Law & Justice

Title: An act relating to attorneys’ fees, costs, and expenses awarded against state and
other units of government.

Brief Description: Providing of payment of attorneys’ fees, costs, and expenses in
actions against governmental units.

Sponsors: Representatives Hickel, Delvin, Smith, Crouse, Padden, Dyer, Costa,
Schoesler, Johnson, Thompson, Beeksma, Radcliff, Cairnes, Mastin, Carrell,
Chappell, Foreman, Fuhrman, Campbell, Morris and Casada.

Brief History:
Committee Activity:

Law & Justice: 1/20/95, 1/31/95, 2/7/95 [DPS].

HOUSE COMMITTEE ON LAW & JUSTICE

Majority Report: The substitute bill be substituted therefor and the substitute bill do
pass. Signed by 13 members: Representatives Padden, Chairman; Delvin, Vice
Chairman; Hickel, Vice Chairman; Appelwick, Ranking Minority Member;
Campbell; Carrell; Chappell; Lambert; McMahan; Morris; Robertson; Sheahan and
Smith.

Minority Report: Do not pass. Signed by 4 members: Representatives Costa,
Assistant Ranking Minority Member; Cody; Thibaudeau and Veloria.

Staff: Edie Adams (786-7180).

Background: In Washington, a prevailing party is not entitled to an award of
attorneys’ fees as part of the cost of litigation unless a statute or contract specifically
provides for payment of attorneys’ fees to the prevailing party.

The federal government and many other states have passed "Equal Access to Justice"
statutes which provide for an award of attorneys’ fees and costs of litigation to
specified nongovernmental prevailing parties when the position of the government is
not substantially justified.
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Summary of Substitute Bill: In all civil actions, including appeals, in which the
state, a political subdivision, a municipal corporation, or a department or agent of the
state, a political subdivision or a municipal corporation is a party, the governmental
party shall pay the nongovernmental party’s reasonable attorneys’ fees, costs, and
litigation expenses if the nongovernmental party prevails.

Prevailing party is defined as the party in whose favor judgment is entered or the
party who prevails on the majority of issues.

The act specifically exempts: (1) quasi-municipal corporations or special purpose
districts; (2) cities with a population less than 7,500; (3) civil infraction actions; (4)
vehicle impoundment hearings; and (5) driver’s license actions.

The act applies to all actions pending on or commenced after July 1, 1995.

Substitute Bill Compared to Original Bill: The substitute bill applies only to civil
actions, and specifically exempts civil infraction actions, vehicle impoundment
hearings, and driver’s license actions. The substitute bill specifically exempts quasi-
municipal corporations, special purpose districts, and cities with a population less than
7,500.

The substitute adds a definition of prevailing party and applies to all actions pending
on or commenced after July 1, 1995.

Appropriation: None.

Fiscal Note: Available.

Effective Date of Substitute Bill: The bill contains an emergency clause and takes
effect on July 1, 1995.

Testimony For: Litigation is very expensive and often the costs of litigation are
higher than any expected judgment. Individuals are deterred from pursuing actions
because of the costs involved, especially in actions involving the government. The
government has infinite resources and can take advantage of individuals and small
businesses who have limited resources. This bill will even the playing field between
the government and small businesses and individuals. The bill will not open the
floodgates to litigation because it is too costly for individuals and small businesses to
pursue frivolous lawsuits.

Testimony Against: This bill represents enormous potential costs on local
governments and cities. These costs will ultimately be paid by the taxpayers. Local
governments, cities, and towns have very limited resources which are needed to pay
for basic services. This bill will encourage individuals to bring more suits against
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counties, cities, and towns and will encourage attorney involvement from the
beginning, decreasing the likelihood of settlement. Currently most suits involving
governmental entities are settled. This bill is inequitable because there is no system
to determine whether the governmental party had a legitimate claim. Many suits
brought by cities or counties are required to comply with state or federal law.

Testified: Representative Timothy Hickel, prime sponsor; Richard Sanders, citizen
(pro); Suzie Rao, Building Industry Association of Washington (pro); Jim
Whitttenburg, pharmacist (pro); Terry Van Doren, Washington Cattlemen’s
Association (pro); Bill Fritz, lobbyist (pro); Jim McDonald, Association of
Washington Cities (con); Lewis Leigh, Washington Cities Insurance Authority (con);
Sonja Alexander, City of Bellevue (con); Lorraine Wilson, Washington School
Directors Association (con); Kurt Sharar (con); and Betty Reed, State Risk Manager,
Department of General Administration.
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